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To
Indian Red Cross,

Sir,
SUB : Report on the event conducted during

NATIONAL YOUTH CAMP-Reg.

SSN YRC unit has organized a one-day National Youth Camp in association with Indian Red
Cross Society TNB, Chengalpattu and Kanchipuram District on 25/01/2023 (Wednesday). The
main objective of this camp is to honour the birth anniversary of Swami Vivekananda and to
make aware youth of the country about the ideas and ideals of Swami Vivekananda. The camp
was planned and organized under the guidance of Dr. V. E. Annamalai, Principal, SSN CE. The
campwas started with hoisting of Red Cross Flag by Selvi. Abhilasha Kaur, IAS, Assistant
Collector. The inauguration ceremony started with the floral tribute to Swami Vivekanandha and
lighting of kuthuvilakku. Dr. V. Thiyagarajan, YRC ProgrammeOfficer, SSN CE was delivered the
welcome address by highlighting Swamiji’s vision and his faith in youths. Dr. S. Radha, Vice
Principal, SSN CE has delivered the Principal address. The Chief Guest of the event is Selvi
Abhilasha Kaur, IAS, Assistant Collector, Chengalpattu District and the Guest of Honour is Dr. S.
Thanigaiarasu, YRC Coordinator, Anna University, Chennai. Dr. S. Jeevananthan, District
Chairman, IRCS Kanchipuram District, Pulavar R. Manickam, District Secretary, IRCS
Chengalpattu District, Mr. R. Mohana Venkatesan, Vice Chairman, IRCS Chengalpattu District
were present during the camp.

Around 250 participants were present during the camp including the YRC ProgrammeOfficers
and YRC Student Volunteers from various colleges including SSN College of Engineering,
Jerusalem College of Engineering, Panimalar Engineering College Chennai City Campus, Sri
Sairam Engineering College, Sri Sairam Institute of Technology , SRM Valliammai Engineering
Architecture. The certificates were distributed to the
participants during the valedictory function.



College, St.Joseph College Of Engineering, St.Joseph's Institute of Technology, Thangavelu Engineering
College andMeasi Academy of







Yours Faithfully,
Mr. L.N.NARAYANAN
Program Officer


